
 

 

 

Representative for Mr. R. Jacaj. 

Response to Neighbourhood Compliance Officer regarding 14 Lansdowne Rd Manchester. 

The representation was made under the prevention of public nuisance. 

On receiving the representation, I contacted the Compliance officer to introduce myself and to 

discuss her points. On point one the supply of alcohol to seated patrons and only ancillary to the 

meal. I pointed out that the application was for the on and off sale of alcohol for a premise not an 

application for a specific business style and her condition was onerous and could not be reasonably 

considered under current guidance. I explained that total capacity was approx. 30 people and 

pointed out the terminal hour alcohol was 21.30 with end of trade at 22.00. The officer reiterated 

that she thought the condition was justified. 

I asked if she had ever had reason to visit the site regarding any type of public nuisance complaint 

raised by any resident or other persons in the five years the applicant had operated the site. She 

confirmed she had not. I asked if she had ever had reason to visit the site for a breach of the 

Environmental Protection act 1990, she said she had not.  I asked if she was aware of any public 

nuisance issues in the area that may be attributed to the conduct of the applicants premise, she had 

not. The officer still felt the condition was needed. 

On the 22nd of October I e-mailed the officer to formally request the withdrawal of her objection. I 

have provided copies to Manchester Licensing Authority. In the reply the officer rightly points out 

that each application is assessed on its own merits. Below is taken from section 182 guidance.  

1.16 Each application must be considered on its own merits and in accordance with the licensing 

authority’s statement of licensing policy where, for example, its effect on cumulative impact is 

relevant. Conditions attached to licences and certificates must be tailored to the individual type, 

location and characteristics of the premises and events concerned. This is essential to avoid the 

imposition of disproportionate and overly burdensome conditions on premises where there is 

no need for such conditions. Standardised conditions should be avoided and indeed may be 

unlawful where they cannot be shown to be appropriate for the promotion of the licensing 

objectives in an individual case. 

Based on this guidance and no evidence being presented by the compliance officer that the 

condition is required and that without the condition requested being included in the licence that it 

would lead to public nuisance I ask the committee to grant the licence without such condition. 

Since our conversation, and after the original hearing had been postponed the compliance 

officer found cause to visit the site and has presented evidence of smoking taking place on the 



premise. This appears to be a clear effort to gather information to support the representation. 

As this action was only taken to try to prove a point, I consider it vexatious. 



 

 

 

Representative for Mr. R. Jacaj. 

Response to North Neighbourhood Team regarding 14 Lansdowne Rd Manchester. 

The representation was made under. The prevention of crime and disorder, The prevention of public 
nuisance, Public safety 

On receiving the representation, I contacted the Neighbourhood officer by e-mail to introduce 

myself and inform him I would like an opportunity to speak with him regarding his representation. 

We subsequently had a telephone conversation on the 23rd of October the call lasted five or so 

minutes during which I tried to establish where his concerns had come from as I was unaware of any 

representations other than the one he had submitted and the one from the compliance officer. I had 

certainly not had any from GMP. The conversation deteriorated and Mr Pemberton told me he was 

not going to have the hearing by telephone. We agreed to stop the conversation at that point. 

I then e-mailed Mr. Pemberton on the same day (copies of all e-mails forwarded to Manchester 

Licensing Authority for inclusion) you will see from the reply I received, evidence to support his claim 

was not available. I have not received any further correspondence or contact from Mr. Pemberton. 

As per details in my e-mail I submitted a freedom of information request to Manchester City Council. 

I have forwarded the response to Manchester Licensing Authority for inclusion. 

Mr. Pemberton has made profoundly serious allegations of misconduct from this premise and the 

behaviour of my client without foundation. He incorrectly accused the premise of selling alcohol 

outside permitted hours. There are no current permitted hours for this building. 

I object in the strongest sense to this representation, it has caused myself and my client considerable 

time, effort, and, cost to investigate the claims detailed by Mr. Pemberton.   

I ask that this representation be dismissed, and the application granted without condition other than 

those volunteered by the applicant. 



Emails Submitted by  03/12/2020 

From:  

Date: Thu, 3 Dec 2020 at 16:45 

Subject: FW: Representation 14 Lansdowne Rd 

To: premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Hi, 

For inclusion in the hearing on the 7th December. 

Kind regards 

 

From: Brian Pemberton <brian.pemberton@manchester.gov.uk> 

Sent: 28 October 2020 07:54 

To:  

Subject: Re: Representation 14 Lansdowne Rd 

Good morning 

Firstly, my apologies for my delayed response to your email

As discussed in our phone call, as Neighbourhood Officer, my role includes sharing 
license applications such as the one for 14 Lansdowne Road with GMP,  Members and 
relevant teams within the Council. This gives the opportunity for parties to raise any 
concerns. these were noted in my submission. 

As per my submission, GMP have concerns regarding the license application. I have 
since contacted GMP for details regarding incidents at 14 Lansdowne Road and to date I 
have not received a response. 

Thanks

Brian Pemberton

From:  

Sent: Friday, October 23, 2020 3:03 PM 

To: Brian Pemberton <brian.pemberton@manchester.gov.uk> 

Cc: Premises Licensing <Premises.Licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Subject: RE: Representation 14 Lansdowne Rd

Dear Mr. Pemberton, 



Thank you for the time on the phone earlier today. Your representation makes some 

serious allegations. In order for me to accurately assess the impact you believe granting 

a premise licence to 14 Lansdowne Rd may have. Would kindly let me have minutes from 

all documented meetings you have had with GMP, Environmental heath, any resident 

association and Ward councillors that relate directly to your representation for 14 

Lansdowne Rd. Copies of any complaints received by any of the persons you mention in 

your representations will be required as well please. 

I’m asking if you will give this information voluntarily and in a timely fashion, by 

28th October, so the hearing may go ahead on the scheduled date and time. 

If you would prefer not to give this information I’m happy to make a request under the 

freedom of information act, this of course may result in me asking for an adjournment of 

the hearing. 

Kind regards 

 

 

From: Brian Pemberton <brian.pemberton@manchester.gov.uk> 

Sent: 22 October 2020 09:23 

To:  

Subject: Re: Representation 14 Lansdowne Rd 

Good morning

Happy to discuss, my mobile number is 

Thanks

Brian

From:  

Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 1:38 PM 

To: Brian Pemberton <brian.pemberton@manchester.gov.uk> 

Subject: Representation 14 Lansdowne Rd

Dear Mr. Pemberton, 

My name Is  I’m the representative for the applicant in this matter. I’m in 

receipt of you representation to Manchester Licensing Authority. I would like the 

opportunity to discuss your concerns prior to any licensing committee hearing. 



My contact details are at the bottom of the mail. I am more than happy to ring you at 

time convenient to both of us If you prefer. In this instance let me have your number and 

availability please. 

Kind regards 

 

 

 



FOI Submitted by  03/12/2020 

From:  

Date: Thu, 3 Dec 2020 at 16:44 

Subject: FW: [FOI/3300] 14 Lansdowne Rd Manchester M8 5SH 

To: premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Hi, 

For inclusion in the hearing on the 7th of December. 

Kind regards 

 

From: foi@manchester.gov.uk <foi@manchester.gov.uk> 

Sent: 26 November 2020 15:18 

To:  

Subject: [FOI/3300] 14 Lansdowne Rd Manchester M8 5SH 

Date: 26 November 2020

Dear 

Re: Request for Information – 14 Lansdowne Rd, Manchester M8 5SH– Reference 
Number: FOI/00003300

Thank you for your request for information, which was received by Manchester City 
Council on 2 November 2020 and has been considered under the provisions of the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 (“the 2000 Act”).

Refusal - information not held by the Council

Subject: 14 Lansdowne Rd Manchester M8 5SH

1. Any incident reports relating to gang violence in the last 5 years.
Manchester City Council does not hold any records relating to the information requested 
above. You may wish to contact Greater Manchester Police as they are more likely to 
hold this type of information. They can be contacted at the following 
address: https://www.gmp.police.uk/rqo/request/ri/request-information/

2. Any resident complaints to EHO or ward councillors regarding public nuisance 
in the last 5 years. AND
3. Any meeting minutes between neighbourhood officer Mr. B. Pemberton and 
ward councillors along with meeting minutes between Mr. B. Pemberton and GMP 
regarding crime and disorder at the premise.
Manchester City Council does not hold any records relating to the information requested 
above.



If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review process, you have the right 
to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision.

The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113
Fax: 01625 524510
www.ico.org.uk

If you have any queries about this letter please contact me. Please remember to quote 
the reference number above in any future communications. If you have received this 
response by email, please leave the email's subject line unchanged when responding to 
it. 

Yours sincerely
Anne Taylor
Strategic Lead-Neighbourhoods (North)
North Neighbourhood Team
Neighbourhoods Directorate
Manchester City Council



Emails submitted by  04/12/2020 

From: > 

Date: Fri, 4 Dec 2020 at 09:28 

Subject: FW: 14 Lansdowne Road, Crumpsall. 

To: Premises Licensing <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

To be included in Hearing bundle for 7th December. 

Kind regards 

 

From: Claire Cunningham <c.cunningham@manchester.gov.uk> 

Sent: 19 October 2020 18:43 

To:  

Cc: Premises Licensing <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Subject: Re: 14 Lansdowne Road, Crumpsall. 

Hi  

Further to our conversation I will not be withdrawing the proposed conditions.  Each 

application is assessed on its own merits.  We consider the conditions based on the type 

of business to be operating from the premise. 

The licence has been assessed is on its current operation as a cafe/restaurant and when I 

spoke to Mr Jacaj on 4th October 2020 he informed me he wanted to continue running 

the business as a cafe/restaurant but also wanted to serve alcohol.  The Licensing Act 

2003 Model Conditions are therefore applied when submitting a representation. 

The Licensing and Out of Hours team serve Noise Abatement notices under the 

Environmental Protection Act 1990.  As a team we aim to prevent public nuisance 

when assessing premise licence applications. 

I understand you may now wish to proceed to a Committee Hearing. 

Regards, 

Claire 

Claire Cunningham 

Licensing & Out of Hours Officer 

Licensing & Out of Hours Compliance 

The Neighbourhoods Service 

Growth and Neighbourhoods Directorate 



Tel: 0161 227 3147 

Mob: 07817 014957 

E-mail c.cunningham@manchester.gov.uk



Emails 2 submitted by  04/12/2020 

From:  

Date: Fri, 4 Dec 2020 at 09:29 

Subject: FW: 14 Lansdowne Road, Crumpsall. 

To: Premises Licensing <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Hi, 

To be included in the bundle for the hearing on the 7th December. 

Kind regards 

 

From:  

Sent: 22 October 2020 15:42 

To: Claire Cunningham <c.cunningham@manchester.gov.uk> 

Subject: RE: 14 Lansdowne Road, Crumpsall. 

Hi Claire, 

Thank you for the reply. So I can understand fully your representation can you please put 

in writing for me why you consider the application would breach the public nuisance 

objective if granted without the condition you have requested in relation to the 

consumption of alcohol? Given that the sale of alcohol will cease at 9-30pm and the 

premise will close at 10pm and the capacity of the building is approximately 30 persons. 

Also can  you give me an understanding on how you think the applicant can police the 

condition regarding the amount f people outside the building at any one time? 

Kind regards 

 

From: Claire Cunningham <c.cunningham@manchester.gov.uk> 

Sent: 19 October 2020 18:43 

To:  

Cc: Premises Licensing <premises.licensing@manchester.gov.uk> 

Subject: Re: 14 Lansdowne Road, Crumpsall. 

Hi  



Further to our conversation I will not be withdrawing the proposed conditions.  Each 

application is assessed on its own merits.  We consider the conditions based on the type 

of business to be operating from the premise. 

The licence has been assessed is on its current operation as a cafe/restaurant and when I 

spoke to Mr Jacaj on 4th October 2020 he informed me he wanted to continue running 

the business as a cafe/restaurant but also wanted to serve alcohol.  The Licensing Act 

2003 Model Conditions are therefore applied when submitting a representation. 

The Licensing and Out of Hours team serve Noise Abatement notices under the 

Environmental Protection Act 1990.  As a team we aim to prevent public nuisance 

when assessing premise licence applications. 

I understand you may now wish to proceed to a Committee Hearing. 

Regards, 

Claire 

Claire Cunningham 

Licensing & Out of Hours Officer 

Licensing & Out of Hours Compliance 

The Neighbourhoods Service 

Growth and Neighbourhoods Directorate 

Tel: 0161 227 3147 

Mob: 07817 014957 

E-mail c.cunningham@manchester.gov.uk


